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From: Indian Journal of Physiotherapy & Occupational Therapy <editor.ijpot@gmail.com>
Date: Rab, 19 Sep 2018 17.17

Subject: Re:

To: Muhammad Suhron <desuhron@gmail.com>

[ have pleasure to inform you that your paper has been accepted for publication.
Payment from western union will NOT be accepted
Pay 100US$ as manuscript handling charges.

You can make the payment by any of the following methods either

1. You can pay by PayPal our id is rksharmal @gmail.com

2. Bank details for Forex transactions

Name of Bank Dhanlaxmi Bank
Branch Nehru Place, New Delhi
Name Ramesh Kumar Sharma
Account Saving

Account Number 019300100018664
IFSC/ RTGS code DLXB0000193

Swift Code / BIC code DLXBINBBDEL

Your acceptance letter would be sent after receipt of charges.

On Mon, Sep 17, 2018 at 1:21 PM, Muhammad Suhron <desuhron@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Dr R K Sharma & Dr. Archna Sharma, Editor of Indian Journal of Physiotherapy &
Occupational Therapy

thaks you for the revision. i am very sorry for the late response. here i send there
revision manuscript. i have i have already change the indian Journal of publich helath
research & development guideline. please find the attachment. i am looking forward to
hearing from you. thaks you

Best Regard,

M. Suhron
Corresponden Email: desuhron@gmail.com
CONTACT +6282231230066
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Yours sincerely

Dr Kavita Behal MPT, MIAP
Sub-Editor
on behalf of

Editor-in-Chief

Dr. Archna Sharma

Head. Dept. of Physiotherapy, G. M. Modi Hospital,
Saket,New Delhi - 110 017
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Executive Editor, IJPOT
Institute of Medico-legal Publications
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